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GIUNCO OUTDOOR FLOOR LAMP

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


50 + 20cm H 

Outdoor lamp with a thin natural copper structure with 
pike and etched Borosilicate glass diffuser.

LED G4 12V Lamp
 
Quantity: 3 + 1 SAMPLE

GIUNCO OUTDOOR FLOOR LAMP

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


200 + 20cm H

Outdoor lamp with a thin natural copper structure with 
pike and etched Borosilicate glass diffuser.

LED G4 12V Lamp
 
Quantity: 4

https://sarsfieldbrooke.co.nz/catalogue/3448/giunco-bollard-light/
https://sarsfieldbrooke.co.nz/catalogue/3448/giunco-bollard-light/


REGOLO OUTDOOR CEILING LIGHT

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


50 H 

(SAMPLE) Outdoor adjustable ceiling light in aluminium 
with a anodizing dark bronze finish & intergrated light 
source in 3000°k White. 

 Quantity: 1 

REGOLO OUTDOOR CEILING LIGHT

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


7.5 x 27 H


(SAMPLE) Outdoor adjustable lamp in aluminium with a 
anodizing dark bronze finish & intergrated light source in 
3000°k White. 

 Quantity: 1 



TWIN-LED OUTDOOR FLOOR LAMP

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


7.5 x 3.5 / 6 / 26 H


(SAMPLE) Outdoor fixed lamp in black ppolycarbonate 
& double intergrated light source - 3000°k White + Blue. 
 
Quantity: 1 

TWIN-LED OUTDOOR WALL LIGHT

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


7 x 4 / 10 x 7.5 H 

(SAMPLE) Outdoor wall lamp in satined steel & double 
intergrated light source in 2700°k White. 

 Quantity: 1 



SOFFIO OUTDOOR FLOOR LAMP

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


2.5 Dia x 72.5 H (8x10 base)


(SAMPLE) Outdoor lamp with a flexible copper rod with 
copper base. Silicone diffuser with a 3000°K white light 
source. 

Quantity: 1 

SOFFIO OUTDOOR FLOOR LAMP

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


5 Dia x 75 H (8x10 base) 

(SAMPLE) Outdoor lamp with a flexible copper rod with 
copper base. Silicone diffuser with a red light source. 

Quantity: 1 

https://sarsfieldbrooke.co.nz/catalogue/3079/soffio-outdoor-lighting/
https://sarsfieldbrooke.co.nz/catalogue/3079/soffio-outdoor-lighting/


SOFFIO OUTDOOR FLOOR LAMP

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


5 Dia x 65 + 20 H 

(SAMPLE) Outdoor lamp with a flexible copper rod, 
included picket. Silicone diffuser with a 2700°K white 
light source. 

Quantity: 1 

SOFFIO OUTDOOR FLOOR LAMP

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


5 Dia x 65 + 20 H 

(SAMPLE) Outdoor lamp with a flexible copper rod, 
included picket. Silicone diffuser with a blue light source. 

Quantity: 1 

https://sarsfieldbrooke.co.nz/catalogue/3079/soffio-outdoor-lighting/
https://sarsfieldbrooke.co.nz/catalogue/3079/soffio-outdoor-lighting/


SOFFIO OUTDOOR FLOOR LAMP

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


2.5 Dia x 62.5 + 20 H 

(SAMPLE) Outdoor lamp with a flexible copper rod, 
included picket. Silicone diffuser with a blue light source. 

Quantity: 1 

SOFFIO OUTDOOR FLOOR LAMP

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


2.5 Dia x 62.5 + 20 H 

(SAMPLE) Outdoor lamp with a flexible copper rod, 
included picket. Silicone diffuser with a red light source. 

Quantity: 1 

https://sarsfieldbrooke.co.nz/catalogue/3079/soffio-outdoor-lighting/
https://sarsfieldbrooke.co.nz/catalogue/3079/soffio-outdoor-lighting/


CONTATTO CEILING / WALL LIGHT

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


10 x 8cm 

(SAMPLE) Wall / ceiling light with a brass painted 
structure and integrated light’s source. 
 
Quantity: 1 

CONCRETA OUTDOOR FLOOR LAMP

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


21 Diameter x 20 H 

Outdoor fixed lamp with structure in natural concrete, 
LED lighting system. 

 Quantity: 1 

https://sarsfieldbrooke.co.nz/catalogue/3049/contatto-wall-light/
https://sarsfieldbrooke.co.nz/catalogue/3117/concreta-outdoor-lighting/


CONTATTO CEILING / WALL LIGHT

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


10 x 8cm 

(SAMPLE) Wall / ceiling light with a black painted 
structure and integrated light’s source. 
 
Quantity: 1 

CONTATTO CEILING / WALL LIGHT

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


10 x 8cm 

(SAMPLE) Wall / ceiling light with a white painted 
structure and integrated light’s source. 
 
Quantity: 1 

https://sarsfieldbrooke.co.nz/catalogue/3049/contatto-wall-light/
https://sarsfieldbrooke.co.nz/catalogue/3049/contatto-wall-light/


CU_BOX OUTDOOR WALL LIGHT

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


10 x 8cm


(SAMPLE) Wall light with a black painted aluminium with 
polyester powder structure & LED light source. 
 
Quantity: 1 

CU_BOX WALL LIGHT

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


10 x 8cm


(SAMPLE) Wall light with a white painted aluminium with 
polyester powder structure & LED light source. 
 
Quantity: 1 



CU_BOX OUTDOOR FLOOR LAMP

MADE IN ITALY BY ANTONANGELI


30 + 20cm H 

(SAMPLE) Outdoor fixed lamp in black painted 
aluminium with epoxy powder & intergrated light source. 
 
Quantity: 1 


